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Capital Funding Analysis

Overview and Key Assumptions

®  Davenport analyzed the County’s ability to strategically and responsibly issue new debt using the following important
concepts as a framework:

1. Debt Capacity

— Debt Capacity is defined as the “relative level(s) of debt a local government can reasonably take on over a period
of years and remain comparable to its peers and financial policies.”
— Can be measured in terms of compliance with the County’s Financial Policies and industry wide best practices.

2. Debt Affordability

— Debt Affordability is defined as the “cash-flow impact to a locality when taking on a certain level(s) of debt on
your current and future annual budgets.”

— Can be measured in terms of Real Estate Tax Equivalent impact.

®  The enclosed analysis incorporates planning estimates for financing of:

1. Radio Project ($5.86 million); and
2. School Project ($9.07 million); and

Total Project Funding is
approximately $16.2 Million.

3. Admin Center Project ($1.28 million).

®  The enclosed analysis does not yet incorporate:
1. The impact of operating pressures including Public Safety, Social Services, Schools, etc.; or

2. The impact of other general fund and school capital and rolling stock related requirements.
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Capital Funding Analysis (cont.)

Overview and Key Assumptions

®  Assumes the County strategically utilizes a Debt Service Stabilization Fund to pay for debt service during years in which
payments exceed revenues.

— The County’s Debt Service Stabilization Fund will begin FY 2020 with a balance of $1,242,497,

®  The Debt Affordability Analysis assumes the County begins with annual, recurring revenues (i.e. Debt Service Budget)
of $1,437,407 - equal to FY 2020 payments on existing debt.

®  The cash-flow impact of the Capital Funding (i.e. the additional revenue needed to pay debt service) is measured in terms
of Real Estate Tax Equivalent units.

— Assumes the Value of 1 penny on the Real Estate Tax Rate = $175,000.

— No growth in the Value of 1 penny is assumed in the analysis.

®  The interest rates used in the capital planning herein are based upon actual bids received for a Direct Bank Loan and
Current Market Estimates for a VRA/VPSA loan.

(1) From reimbursement of the initial payment on the Motorola Project made in January 2020 per County Staff.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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Bid Summary

Purpose

Maximum Par Amount

Tax Status

Security/Collateral

Interest Rate

Interest Mode

Final Maturity

Prepayment Provisions

STERLING

NATIONAL BANK

2020A - New Money County Capital Projects
2020B - Refunding of Series 2017 Bond
2020C - Refunding of Series 2013 Bond

2020A (New Money) - $16,600,000
2020B (Refunds 2017 Bond) - $1,750,000
2020C (Refunds 2013 Bond)- $6,700,000

2020A (New Money) - Tax-Exempt
2020B (Refunds 2017 Bond) - Tax-Exempt
2020C (Refunds 2013 Bond) - Provided Taxable and Tax-Exempt rates.

"Moral Obligation pledge of the County’s Board of Supervisors, a Lease Agreement
between the Authority and the County, a Ground Lease on one or more County buildings,
and an Assignment Agreement that would assign the leases to the lender as collateral."

2020A (New Money)

2020B (Refunds 2017 Bond) | 2020C (Refunds 2013 Bond)

Amortization 1 - 2.96%
Amortization 2 - 3.00%

2.45% 2.39%

Fixed through Final Maturity.

2020A (New Money) - February 1, 2041.
2020B (Refunds 2017 Bond) - February 1, 2033.
2020C (Refunds 2013 Bond) - February 1, 2033.

Before 1/31/2025 - No Call.
On or After 2/1/2025 - Prepayable In whole, but not in part, anytime at par.

Key Government
Finance

2020A - New Money County Capital Projects
2020B - Refunding of Series 2017 Bond
2020C - Refunding of Series 2013 Bond

2020A (New Money) - No Bid
2020B (Refunds 2017 Bond) - $1,750,000
2020C (Refunds 2013 Bond) - $6,700,000

2020A (New Money) - No Bid
2020B (Refunds 2017 Bond) - Tax-Exempt
2020C (Refunds 2013 Bond) - Provided Taxable and Tax-Exempt rates.

"Moral Obligation pledge of the County’s Board of Supervisors, a Lease Agreement
between the Authority and the County, a Ground Lease on a County building(s), and an
Assignment Agreement that would assign the leases to the lender as collateral or a
comparable lease financing structure."

2020A

2020B (Refunds 2017 Bond) | 2020C (Refunds 2013 Bond)

No Bid 2.868% 2.636%

Fixed through Final Maturity.

2020A (New Money) - No Bid.
2020B (Refunds 2017 Bond) - February 1, 2033.
2020C (Refunds 2013 Bond) - February 1, 2033.

Prepayable in whole, but not in part, anytime at par.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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Interest Rate Environment | Tax-Exempt
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Long term interest rates have continued to decline and remain at historical lows.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY

Note: Graphs show data for the Bond Buyer 20-Bond Index through Thursday, May 22, 2020.
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Tax Exempt Interest Trends Since the Beginning of 2020

* Tax Exempt Interest Rates have been highly volatile in 2020 due to the COVID19 crisis and its impact on the financial

markets.

* Public market interest rates have moved by as much as 200 basis points (2%) over the course of just a few weeks as early

as March.

* Current market interest rates have settled back to near all-time lows but there is no way to know with certainty the

movement of rates in the future.
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Summary of Cases — Assumptions and Results
New Money Financing Only

I Y N T

New Money Financing Assumptions

Summer VRA Pool - Radio & Admin Center

Sterling Direct Bank Loan Fall VPSA Pool - School

Funding Source

New Money Interest Rate 2.96% Estimated Rates as of 5/19/20

Project Amount and Term Radio - $5.86M - 15 Years | Admin Center - $1.28M - 20 Years | School- $9.07M - 20 Years

Prepayment Provisions 5 Years, No Penalty. 10 Years, No Penalty.

Strategic Refunding/Restructuring Assumptions

Funding Source N/A N/A
Refunding Interest Rate N/A N/A
Prepayment Provisions N/A N/A

Max Debt Service vs. Expenditures

Max Debt vs. Assessed Value

Estimated Total Debt Service Paid

Estimated Capital Planning Results

5.30% (FY 2023)

1.28% (FY 2021)

5.20% (FY 2022)

1.13% (FY 2021)

$33,020,785 $31,164,852
Over the Life of the Debt Profile!®
Real Estate Tax Equivalent Impact
FY 2022 1.0¢ 1.0¢
FY 2023 0.0¢ 0.0¢
FY 2024 1.5¢ 0.5¢
Total 2.5¢ 1.5¢

DAVENPORT & COMPANY Note: Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Based on bank rate proposals and rates estimated as of 5/19/20. Actual results may vary from these estimates.
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Summary of Cases — Assumptions and Results
New Money Financing with Strategic Refunding/Restructuring

e e e e p

Funding Source

New Money Interest Rate
Project Amount and Term

Prepayment Provisions

Funding Source

Refunding Interest Rate

Prepayment Provisions

Max Debt Service vs. Expenditures

Max Debt vs. Assessed Value

Estimated Total Debt Service Paid
Over the Life of the Debt Profile!®

Real Estate Tax Equivalent Impact

FY 2022
FY 2023
FY 2024

Total

New Money Financing Assumptions

Sterling Direct Bank Loan

3.00%

Summer VRA Pool - Radio & Admin Center

Fall VPSA Pool - School

Estimated Rates as of 5/19/20

Radio - $5.86M - 15 Years | Admin Center - $1.28M - 20 Years | School - $9.07M - 20 Years

5 Years, No Penalty.

Strategic Refunding/Restructuring Assumptions

Sterling Direct Bank Loan

2.37% - Refunding of the 2017 Bond
2.39% - Refunding of the 2013 Bond

5 Years, No Penalty.
Estimated Capital Planning Results
4.70% (FY 2025)

1.30% (FY 2021)

$34,394,037

1.0¢
0.0¢
0.0¢

1.0¢

10 Years, No Penalty.

Summer VRA Pool

Estimated Rates as of 5/19/20
Refunding of the 2017 Bond
Refunding of the 2013 Bond

10 Years, No Penalty.

4.57% (FY 2022)

1.08% (FY 2021)

$31,892,845

0.5¢
0.0¢
0.0¢

0.5¢

DAVENPORT & COMPANY Note: Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Based on bank rate proposals and rates estimated as of 5/19/20. Actual results may vary from these estimates.
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Next Steps

®m Tuesday, May 26

®m  Tuesday, June 9

m | ate May / Early June

®m | ate May / Early June

®m  Friday, June 19

By Friday, June 26

Meeting of the Board of Supervisors
Davenport updates the Board of Supervisors on the results of the competitive
RFP bidding process and recommended next steps.

Meeting of the Board of Supervisors
The Board of Supervisors formally approves Authorizing Resolutions for
the Direct Bank Loan approach and/or VRA approach.

Meeting of the County’s Industrial Development Authority (IDA).
The IDA approves the financing(s), as necessary.

Meeting of the County School Board.
The School Board approves the financing(s) and collateral, as necessary.

VRA deadline for the County’s local approvals to participate in the Summer
2020 VRA Pool, if VRA is selected and if VRA approves the County’s application
to participate in the Summer 2020 VRA Pool.

Close on a Direct Bank Loan from Sterling National Bank, if Sterling’s
Direct Bank Loan proposal is selected for the New Money and/or Refunding(s).

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
May 26, 2020



Next Steps (cont.)

®  Wednesday, July 22

® Wednesday, August 5

B Summer 2020

® Month of October

® Month of November

Tentatively scheduled VRA Bond sale, if VRA is selected for the Radio Project
New Money, Admin Center Project New Money, and/or Refunding and if the
County’s VRA application is approved. Interest rates locked in at this time.

Tentatively scheduled VRA Closing, if VRA approach is selected and if the
County’s VRA application is approved. Radio Project and/or Admin Center
Project funds are available and/or the Refunding is complete at this time.

VPSA application deadline and deadline for the County’s local approvals to
participate in the Fall 2020 VPSA Pool, if VPSA Pool is selected for the School
Project New Money.

Tentatively scheduled VPSA Bond sale, if VPSA is selected for the School Project
New Money and if the County’s VPSA application is approved. Interest rates
locked in at this time.

Tentatively scheduled VPSA Closing, if VPSA approach is selected and if the
County’s VPSA application is approved. School Project funds are available at
this time.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
May 26, 2020



Capital Funding Case A

Existing Debt Profile - No Refunding

New Money - Tax-Exempt Direct Bank Loan from Sterling — 2.96% Interest Rate
Radio Project - 15 Year Structured Debt Service

Admin Center Project - 20 Year Level Debt Service
School Project - 20 Year Structured Debt Service

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Based on Sterling National Bank’s proposed 2.96% interest rate for the Radio Project, Admin Center Project, and School Project Financings.
Actual results may vary from these estimates.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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Estimated Resulting Debt Service — Case A

A B sumofA: B
3.0 Existing Debt Total New Money Total Debt
Service Debt Service Service

Total $10,378,898 $ 22,641,887 $ 33,020,785
2.5 2020 1,437,407 - 1,437,407
2021 1,428,490 292,612 1,721,102
2022 1,109,231 813,440 1,922,671
2.0 2023 1,109,439 814,731 1,924,170
" 5N N NN - 2024 1,081,765 813,697 1,895,462
§ i I I I I I I 2025 1,081,793 814,396 1,896,189
s 15 | I EEEEEEEE 2026 1,081,956 814,770 1,896,726
@ I I I I I I 2027 1,081,751 814,818 1,896,569
- I 2028 967,066 814,540 1,781,606
1.0 I I I I I I I I EEEEE 2029 - 1,467,937 1,467,937
2030 - 1,466,650 1,466,650
2031 - 1,466,474 1,466,474
0.5 2032 - 1,467,352 1,467,352
2033 - 1,467,223 1,467,223
2034 - 1,468,088 1,468,088
0.0 2035 - 1,466,887 1,466,887
S8 I LK EIXFT O I I IFIHIIIT 2036 - 1,467,650 1,467,650
SRRIIIIIRIRIRIRIRIRK/K/LLLELEEE& LS 2037 ) 082,289 982,289
B Existing Debt Service ® Radio Project ® School Project ® Admin Center 2038 - 982,158 982,158
2039 - 982,288 982,288
2040 - 981,648 981,648
2041 - 982,238 982,238

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Based on Sterling National Bank’s proposed 2.96% interest rate for the Radio Project, Admin Center Project, and School Project Financings.
Actual results may vary from these estimates.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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Penny Impact Analysis — Case A

* Penny Impact Analysis assumes the Value of one penny to be $175,000 with no growth in value.

e Assumes the County begins FY 2020 with a Debt Service Stabilization Fund Balance of $1,242,497.

Fiscal
Year
2020
2021
2022
2023
2024
2025
2026
2027
2028
2029
2030
2031
2032
2033
2034
2035
2036
2037
2038
2039
2040
2041

(1) Existing tax supported debt service as of 6/30/2019.

Existing Debt

Service?
$1,437,407
1,428,490
1,109,231
1,109,439
1,081,765
1,081,793
1,081,956
1,081,751
967,066
0

O O O O OO OO O0oO o OoOOo

Radio Project

$0
105,626
325,232
325,792
325,204
325,498
325,643
325,641
325,490
678,192
678,297
677,928
678,086
678,740
678,862
678,450
678,506

0

o O O O

School
Project
$0
163,435
400,136
400,318
400,381
400,326
400,152
400,860
400,420
700,862
700,275
700,304
700,918
700,089
700,845
700,127
700,966
894,301
893,420
893,888
893,646
893,693

Admin
Center
$0
23,552
88,072
88,622
88,112
88,573
88,974
88,317
88,630
88,883
88,078
88,242
88,348
88,394
88,382
88,310
88,178
87,988
88,738
88,400
88,002
88,546

E=sumA:D F G=E-F

Total Existing

and
Proposed
Debt Service
$1,437,407
1,721,102
1,922,671
1,924,170
1,895,462
1,896,189
1,896,726
1,896,569
1,781,606
1,467,937
1,466,650
1,466,474
1,467,352
1,467,223
1,468,088
1,466,887
1,467,650
982,289
982,158
982,288
981,648
982,238

(2) Debt Service Budget based on the County's existing FY 2020 Debt Service.
(3) Value of one penny on the real estate tax rate assumed to be $175,000.
(4) Additional Revenue equal to cumulative penny increase(s) multiplied by $175,000.

Debt Service
Budget®
$1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407

Additional
Revenue
Required
283,695
485,264
486,763
458,055
458,782
459,319
459,162
344,199
30,530
29,243
29,067
29,945
29,816
30,681
29,480
30,243

H

Incremental
Equivalent
Real Estate

Tax

Impact

2.5¢

Additional
Revenue
Produced

by Tax

Increase®

$0
0
175,000
175,000
437,500
437,500
437,500
437,500
437,500
437,500
437,500
437,500
437,500
437,500
437,500
437,500
437,500
437,500
437,500
437,500
437,500
437,500

J=F+|

Total
Available
Revenues

$1,437,407
1,437,407
1,612,407
1,612,407
1,874,907
1,874,907
1,874,907
1,874,907
1,874,907
1,874,907
1,874,907
1,874,907
1,874,907
1,874,907
1,874,907
1,874,907
1,874,907
1,874,907
1,874,907
1,874,907
1,874,907
1,874,907

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Based on Sterling National Bank’s proposed 2.96% interest rate for the Radio Project, Admin Center Project, and School Project Financings.
Actual results may vary from these estimates.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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Debt Service Stabilization Fund — Case A

* Penny Impact Analysis assumes the Value of one penny to be $175,000 with no growth in value.

e Assumes the County begins FY 2020 with a Debt Service Stabilization Fund Balance of $1,242,497.

J=F+I K=E L=J-K M N=L-M 0]
Surplus/(Deficit) Surplus/(Deficit)
before use of Debt Service after use of

Total Existing Debt Service Stabilization Debt Service Debt Service
Fiscal Total Available and Proposed Stabilization Fund used for Stabilization Stabilization
Year Revenues Debt Service Fund Debt Service Fund Fund Balance
2020 $1,437,407 $1,437,407 $0 $0 $0 $1,242,497
2021 1,437,407 1,721,102 (283,695) (283,695) 0 958,801
2022 1,612,407 1,922,671 (310,264) (310,264) 0 648,537
2023 1,612,407 1,924,170 (311,763) (311,763) 0 336,774
2024 1,874,907 1,895,462 (20,555) (20,555) 0 316,219
2025 1,874,907 1,896,189 (21,282) (21,282) 0 294,937
2026 1,874,907 1,896,726 (21,819) (21,819) 0 273,118
2027 1,874,907 1,896,569 (21,662) (21,662) 0 251,457
2028 1,874,907 1,781,606 93,301 0 93,301 344,758
2029 1,874,907 1,467,937 406,970 0 406,970 751,728
2030 1,874,907 1,466,650 408,257 0 408,257 1,159,985
2031 1,874,907 1,466,474 408,433 0 408,433 1,568,418
2032 1,874,907 1,467,352 407,555 0 407,555 1,975,973
2033 1,874,907 1,467,223 407,684 0 407,684 2,383,657
2034 1,874,907 1,468,088 406,819 0 406,819 2,790,476
2035 1,874,907 1,466,887 408,020 0 408,020 3,198,496
2036 1,874,907 1,467,650 407,257 0 407,257 3,605,752
2037 1,874,907 982,289 892,618 0 892,618 4,498,370
2038 1,874,907 982,158 892,749 0 892,749 5,391,119
2039 1,874,907 982,288 892,619 0 892,619 6,283,738
2040 1,874,907 981,648 893,259 0 893,259 7,176,997
2041 1,874,907 982,238 892,669 0 892,669 8,069,666

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Based on Sterling National Bank’s proposed 2.96% interest rate for the Radio Project, Admin Center Project, and School
Project Financings. Actual results may vary from these estimates.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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Capital Funding Case B

Existing Debt Profile - No Refunding

New Money - Tax-Exempt VRA/VPSA Pool - Estimated Market Rates (5/19/20)
Radio Project - 15 Year Structured Debt Service (VRA)

Admin Center Project — 20 Year Level Debt Service (VRA)

School Project - 20 Year Structured Debt Service (VPSA)

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Assumes an estimated Summer VRA Pooled Financing for the Radio and Admin Center Projects and an estimated Fall VPSA Pooled Financing for the School
Project based on estimated market interest rates of May 19, 2020. Actual results may vary from these estimates.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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Estimated Resulting Debt Service — Case B

A B sumofA: B
3.0 Existing Debt Total New Money Total Debt
Service Debt Service Service

Total $10,378,898 $ 20,785,954 $ 31,164,852
25 2020 1,437,407 . 1,437,407
2021 1,428,490 202,474 1,630,964
2022 1,109,231 776,149 1,885,380
2.0 2023 1,109,439 742,379 1,851,818
0 | g 2024 1,081,765 743,959 1,825,724
S — - 2025 1,081,793 745,028 1,826,821
S 15 I I I I I I I I 2026 1,081,956 745,586 1,827,542
pid I I EmEmEEE . 2027 1,081,751 750,507 1,832,258
. I I I I I 2028 967,066 749,791 1,716,857
1.0 2029 - 1,362,538 1,362,538
4 N N N 2030 - 1,357,983 1,357,983
2031 - 1,361,136 1,361,136
0.5 2032 . 1,351,999 1,351,999
2033 - 1,360,316 1,360,316
2034 - 1,351,512 1,351,512
0.0 2035 - 1,356,092 1,356,092
8&&%&&8'&%%8%%%%%%5%%83 2036 = 1,353,728 1,353,728
SRESRERIJERIRIIRLERILEIRKKIRKERILERR 2037 ) '8991068 '8991068
B Existing Debt Service ™ Radio Project ® School Project ® Admin Center 2038 - 892,526 892,526
2039 - 894,768 894,768
2040 - 894,967 894,967
2041 - 893,450 893,450

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Assumes an estimated Summer VRA Pooled Financing for the Radio and Admin Center Projects and an estimated Fall VPSA Pooled Financing for the School
Project based on estimated market interest rates of May 19, 2020. Actual results may vary from these estimates.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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Penny Impact Analysis — Case B

* Penny Impact Analysis assumes the Value of one penny to be $175,000 with no growth in value.

e Assumes the County begins FY 2020 with a Debt Service Stabilization Fund Balance of $1,242,497.

Fiscal
Year
2020
2021
2022
2023
2024
2025
2026
2027
2028
2029
2030
2031
2032
2033
2034
2035
2036
2037
2038
2039
2040
2041

(1) Existing tax supported debt service as of 6/30/2019.

Existing Debt
Service®
$1,437,407
1,428,490
1,109,231
1,109,439
1,081,765
1,081,793
1,081,956
1,081,751
967,066
0

O O O OO OO0 OoO OO oo

Radio Project
$0
165,913
297,622
298,650
299,422
299,938
300,197
300,200
299,947
611,238
608,688
609,984
605,128
608,991
604,297
606,300
607,272
0

o O O O

School
Project
$0
0
394,943
361,939
364,540
362,015
364,364
366,460
368,304
667,194
667,751
667,299
665,836
668,238
666,903
667,058
666,403
816,799
813,145
813,378
816,295
812,200

Admin
Center
$0
36,561
83,584
81,791
79,997
83,075
81,025
83,847
81,541
84,106
81,544
83,853
81,034
83,088
80,313
82,734
80,053
82,269
79,381
81,391
78,672
81,250

E=sumA:D F G=E-F

Total Existing
and
Proposed
Debt Service
$1,437,407
1,630,964
1,885,380
1,851,818
1,825,724
1,826,821
1,827,542
1,832,258
1,716,857
1,362,538
1,357,983
1,361,136
1,351,999
1,360,316
1,351,512
1,356,092
1,353,728
899,068
892,526
894,768
894,967
893,450

(2) Debt Service Budget based on the County's existing FY 2020 Debt Service.
(3) Value of one penny on the real estate tax rate assumed to be $175,000.
(4) Additional Revenue equal to cumulative penny increase(s) multiplied by $175,000.

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Assumes an estimated Summer VRA Pooled Financing for the Radio and Admin Center Projects and an estimated Fall VPSA Pooled Financing for the School

Project based on estimated market interest rates of May 19, 2020. Actual results may vary from these estimates.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY

Debt Service
Budget‘®
$1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407
1,437,407

Additional
Revenue
Required
193,557
447,973
414,411
388,317
389,414
390,135
394,851
279,450

H

Incremental

Equivalent
Real Estate
Tax

Impact ®

1.5¢

I J=F+1

Additional

Revenue

Produced Total

by Tax INEHELIE

Increase”  Revenues
$0 $1,437,407
0 1,437,407

175,000 1,612,407
175,000 1,612,407
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
262,500 1,699,907
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Debt Service Stabilization Fund — Case B

* Penny Impact Analysis assumes the Value of one penny to be $175,000 with no growth in value.

e Assumes the County begins FY 2020 with a Debt Service Stabilization Fund Balance of $1,242,497.

J=F+] K=E L=J-K M N=L-M (0]
Surplus/(Deficit) Surplus/(Deficit)
before use of Debt Service after use of

Total Existing Debt Service Stabilization Debt Service Debt Service
Fiscal Total Available and Proposed Stabilization Fund used for Stabilization Stabilization
Year Revenues Debt Service Fund Debt Service Fund Fund Balance
2020 $1,437,407 $1,437,407 $0 $0 $0 $1,242,497
2021 1,437,407 1,630,964 (193,557) (193,557) 0 1,048,939
2022 1,612,407 1,885,380 (272,973) (272,973) 0 775,966
2023 1,612,407 1,851,818 (239,411) (239,411) 0 536,555
2024 1,699,907 1,825,724 (125,817) (125,817) 0 410,738
2025 1,699,907 1,826,821 (126,914) (126,914) 0 283,824
2026 1,699,907 1,827,542 (127,635) (127,635) 0 156,190
2027 1,699,907 1,832,258 (132,351) (132,351) 0 23,839
2028 1,699,907 1,716,857 (16,950) (16,950) 0 6,889
2029 1,699,907 1,362,538 337,369 0 337,369 344,258
2030 1,699,907 1,357,983 341,924 0 341,924 686,183
2031 1,699,907 1,361,136 338,771 0 338,771 1,024,953
2032 1,699,907 1,351,999 347,908 0 347,908 1,372,862
2033 1,699,907 1,360,316 339,591 0 339,591 1,712,453
2034 1,699,907 1,351,512 348,395 0 348,395 2,060,848
2035 1,699,907 1,356,092 343,815 0 343,815 2,404,663
2036 1,699,907 1,353,728 346,179 0 346,179 2,750,843
2037 1,699,907 899,068 800,840 0 800,840 3,551,682
2038 1,699,907 892,526 807,381 0 807,381 4,359,063
2039 1,699,907 894,768 805,139 0 805,139 5,164,202
2040 1,699,907 894,967 804,940 0 804,940 5,969,142
2041 1,699,907 893,450 806,457 0 806,457 6,775,599

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Assumes an estimated Summer VRA Pooled Financing for the Radio and Admin Center Projects and an estimated Fall
VPSA Pooled Financing for the School Project based on estimated market interest rates of May 19, 2020. Actual results may vary from these estimates.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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Capital Funding Case C

New Money - Tax-Exempt Direct Bank Loan from Sterling - 3.00% Interest Rate
Radio Project - 15 Year Level Debt Service

Admin Center Project - 20 Year Level Debt Service

School Project - 20 Year Structured Debt Service

Strategic Refunding/Restructuring — Direct Bank Loans from Sterling
Refunding of the 2017 Bond - 13 Years at 2.37%
Refunding of the 2013 Bond - 13 Years at 2.39%

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Based on Sterling National Bank’s proposed 3.00% interest rate for the Radio Project, Admin Center Project, and School Project Financings; proposed
2.37% interest rate for a tax-exempt refunding of the 2017 Bond; and proposed 2.39% interest rate for a tax-exempt refunding of the 2013 Bond. Actual results may vary from these estimates.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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Case C — Strategic Refunding/Restructuring Opportunity
Refunding/Restructuring of the 2013 and 2017 Bonds
® Davenport identified a potential opportunity to strategically refund/restructure $7.8 million of outstanding tax-supported

debt, consisting of the 2013 Public Facility Lease Revenue Bond (the “2013 Bond”) and 2017 Public Improvement
Refunding Bond (the “2017 Bond”).

®m A Refunding/Restructuring of the 2013 and 2017 Bonds could allow the County to free up cash flow over the next 8 years in
order to mitigate the budgetary impact of the Capital Projects.

® The table below summarizes the 2013 and 2017 Bonds to be considered for the Refunding/Restructuring.

Outstanding

Series/Project 6/30/2020 Interest Rate  Final Maturity Call Provision
2013 Public Facility Lease Revenue Bond $ 6,205,000 2.15% 11/1/2027 11/1/2021 @ 100%
2017 Public Improvement Refunding Bond 1,565,550 2.39% 8/1/2027 8/1/2020 @ 102%
Totals $ 7,770,550

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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Case C — Strategic Refunding/Restructuring Opportunity (cont.)

®m Based on Sterling’s proposal, the Strategic Refunding/Restructuring could potentially:

Free up approximately $2.8 million in cash flow in FY 2021-2028 (see yellow shading below);

Average interest rate on Refunded Debt equal to approximately 2.20%. Average interest rate on Refunding
Debt equal to approximately 2.39%;

At a Present Value Cost of approximately $350,000.

2020
Existing Debt Restructured Restructuring Resulting
Service Debt Service Debt Service Debt Service Savings
Total $10,378,898 $8,539,595 $9,567,527 $11,406,830 ($1,027,932)
2020 $1,437,407 $0 $0 $1,437,407 $0
2021 1,428,490 1,081,658 422,443 769,275 659,215
2022 1,109,231 1,081,699 718,572 746,104 363,127
2023 1,109,439 1,081,907 720,904 748,436 361,003
2024 1,081,765 1,081,765 770,877 770,877 310,888
2025 1,081,793 1,081,793 771,346 771,346 310,448
2026 1,081,956 1,081,956 771,456 771,456 310,500
2027 1,081,751 1,081,751 770,208 770,208 311,543
2028 967,066 967,066 769,627 769,627 197,439
2029 - - 769,687 769,687 (769,687)
2030 771,366 771,366 (771,366)
2031 770,615 770,615 (770,615)
2032 770,482 770,482 (770,482)
2033 769,944 769,944 (769,944)

Estimated Debt Service Before & After
the Refunding/Restructuring

502 I

$0.0 ——
O D > o O A
¥V SV VgV SV oV J¥

S N O D
5 7 HY D
NS S S S S S S T Q7 R

% 0
G
DI S I S S

2020 Restructuring Debt Service I Unrefinanced Debt Service

==Fxisting Debt Service

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Based on Sterling National Bank’s proposed 2.37% interest rate for a tax-exempt refunding of the 2017 Bond; and proposed 2.39% interest rate for a
tax-exempt refunding of the 2013 Bond. Actual results may vary from these estimates.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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Estimated Resulting Debt Service — Case C

A B sumofA: B
3.0 Restructured Total New Money Total Debt
Debt Service Debt Service Service

Total $11,406,830 $ 22,987,207 $ 34,394,037
2.5 2020 1,437,407 - 1,437,407
2021 769,275 296,567 1,065,842
2022 746,104 934,000 1,680,104
2.0 2023 748,436 935,740 1,684,176
o 2024 770,877 935,030 1,705,907
é EmEEEEEEEEEEEEN 2025 771,346 935,930 1,707,276
S 15 I I I I I I I I I I . 2026 771,456 934,380 1,705,836
*g EEEEE 2027 770,208 935,440 1,705,648
- 2028 769,627 935,020 1,704,647
1.0 i I I I I I I I I I I I I 2029 769,687 935,150 1,704,837
[ | 2030 771,366 934,800 1,706,166
2031 770,615 934,970 1,705,585
0.5 2032 770,482 935,630 1,706,112
2033 769,944 935,750 1,705,694
2034 - 1,585,330 1,585,330
0.0 2035 - 1,584,870 1,584,870
SIS ILETIRLIRBR IS IT RS I LT 2036 - 1,584,270 1,584,270
SSSSSSSSSSSSRSKSSR88RK 037 _ 1343500 1343500
® Restructured Debt Service ™ Radio Project ™ School Project ® Admin Center 2038 ) 1,342,730 1,342,730
2039 - 1,342,940 1,342,940
2040 - 1,343,070 1,343,070
2041 - 1,342,090 1,342,090

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Based on Sterling National Bank’s proposed 3.00% interest rate for the Radio Project, Admin Center Project, and School Project Financings; proposed
2.37% interest rate for a tax-exempt refunding of the 2017 Bond; and proposed 2.39% interest rate for a tax-exempt refunding of the 2013 Bond. Actual results may vary from these estimates.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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Penny Impact Analysis — Case C

* Penny Impact Analysis assumes the Value of one penny to be $175,000 with no growth in value.

e Assumes the County begins FY 2020 with a Debt Service Stabilization Fund Balance of $1,242,497.

A B C D E=sumA:D F G=E-F H I J=F+1
Total Incremental LCIIEIIE]
Restructured Equivalent Revenue
Restructured and Additional Real Estate REM{IoIN1¢] Total
Fiscal Debt School Admin Proposed DLETRCLIUIC Revenue Tax by Tax Available
Year  Service'® Radio Project Project Center Debt Service Budget® Required  Impact™ [RIICEE S AN T TY
2020 $1,437,407 $0 $0 $0 $1,437,407 $1,437,407 - - $0 $1,437,407
2021 769,275 107,053 165,643 23,870 1,065,842 1,437,407 - - 0 1,437,407
2022 746,104 495,600 349,800 88,600 1,680,104 1,437,407 242,697 1.0¢ 175,000 1,612,407
2023 748,436 496,060 350,550 89,130 1,684,176 1,437,407 246,769 - 175,000 1,612,407
2024 770,877 496,220 350,210 88,600 1,705,907 1,437,407 268,500 - 175,000 1,612,407
2025 771,346 496,080 350,810 89,040 1,707,276 1,437,407 269,869 - 175,000 1,612,407
2026 771,456 495,640 350,320 88,420 1,705,836 1,437,407 268,429 - 175,000 1,612,407
2027 770,208 495,900 350,770 88,770 1,705,648 1,437,407 268,241 - 175,000 1,612,407
2028 769,627 495,830 350,130 89,060 1,704,647 1,437,407 267,240 - 175,000 1,612,407
2029 769,687 496,430 350,430 88,290 1,704,837 1,437,407 267,430 - 175,000 1,612,407
2030 771,366 495,670 350,640 88,490 1,706,166 1,437,407 268,759 - 175,000 1,612,407
2031 770,615 495,580 350,760 88,630 1,705,585 1,437,407 268,178 - 175,000 1,612,407
2032 770,482 496,130 350,790 88,710 1,706,112 1,437,407 268,705 - 175,000 1,612,407
2033 769,944 496,290 350,730 88,730 1,705,694 1,437,407 268,287 - 175,000 1,612,407
2034 0 496,060 1,000,580 88,690 1,585,330 1,437,407 147,923 - 175,000 1,612,407
2035 0 495,440 1,000,840 88,590 1,584,870 1,437,407 147,463 - 175,000 1,612,407
2036 0 495,430 1,000,410 88,430 1,584,270 1,437,407 146,863 - 175,000 1,612,407
2037 0 0 1,254,290 89,210 1,343,500 1,437,407 - - 175,000 1,612,407
2038 0 0 1,253,830 88,900 1,342,730 1,437,407 - - 175,000 1,612,407
2039 0 0 1,254,410 88,530 1,342,940 1,437,407 - - 175,000 1,612,407
2040 0 0 1,253,970 89,100 1,343,070 1,437,407 - - 175,000 1,612,407
2041 0 0 1,253,510 88,580 1,342,090 1,437,407 - - 175,000 1,612,407
1.0¢

(1) Restructured tax supported debt service as of 6/30/2019.

(2) Debt Service Budget based on the County's existing FY 2020 Debt Service.

(3) Value of one penny on the real estate tax rate assumed to be $175,000.

(4) Additional Revenue equal to cumulative penny increase(s) multiplied by $175,000.

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Based on Sterling National Bank’s proposed 3.00% interest rate for the Radio Project, Admin Center Project, and School Project Financings; proposed
2.37% interest rate for a tax-exempt refunding of the 2017 Bond; and proposed 2.39% interest rate for a tax-exempt refunding of the 2013 Bond. Actual results may vary from these estimates.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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Debt Service Stabilization Fund — Case C

* Penny Impact Analysis assumes the Value of one penny to be $175,000 with no growth in value.

e Assumes the County begins FY 2020 with a Debt Service Stabilization Fund Balance of $1,242,497.

J=F+I K=E L=J-K M N=L-M 0]
Surplus/(Deficit) Surplus/(Deficit)
Total before use of Debt Service after use of

Restructured Debt Service Stabilization Debt Service Debt Service
Fiscal Total Available and Proposed Stabilization Fund used for Stabilization Stabilization
Year Revenues Debt Service Fund Debt Service Fund Fund Balance
2020 $1,437,407 $1,437,407 $0 $0 $0 $1,242,497
2021 1,437,407 1,065,842 371,565 0 371,565 1,614,061
2022 1,612,407 1,680,104 (67,697) (67,697) 0 1,546,364
2023 1,612,407 1,684,176 (71,769) (71,769) 0 1,474,595
2024 1,612,407 1,705,907 (93,500) (93,500) 0 1,381,095
2025 1,612,407 1,707,276 (94,869) (94,869) 0 1,286,227
2026 1,612,407 1,705,836 (93,429) (93,429) 0 1,192,798
2027 1,612,407 1,705,648 (93,241) (93,241) 0 1,099,556
2028 1,612,407 1,704,647 (92,240) (92,240) 0 1,007,317
2029 1,612,407 1,704,837 (92,430) (92,430) 0 914,887
2030 1,612,407 1,706,166 (93,759) (93,759) 0 821,128
2031 1,612,407 1,705,585 (93,178) (93,178) 0 727,950
2032 1,612,407 1,706,112 (93,705) (93,705) 0 634,245
2033 1,612,407 1,705,694 (93,287) (93,287) 0 540,958
2034 1,612,407 1,585,330 27,077 0 27,077 568,035
2035 1,612,407 1,584,870 27,537 0 27,537 595,572
2036 1,612,407 1,584,270 28,137 0 28,137 623,709
2037 1,612,407 1,343,500 268,907 0 268,907 892,616
2038 1,612,407 1,342,730 269,677 0 269,677 1,162,293
2039 1,612,407 1,342,940 269,467 0 269,467 1,431,760
2040 1,612,407 1,343,070 269,337 0 269,337 1,701,097
2041 1,612,407 1,342,090 270,317 0 270,317 1,971,414

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Based on Sterling National Bank’s proposed 3.00% interest rate for the Radio Project, Admin Center Project, and School Project Financings; proposed
2.37% interest rate for a tax-exempt refunding of the 2017 Bond; and proposed 2.39% interest rate for a tax-exempt refunding of the 2013 Bond. Actual results may vary from these estimates.
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Capital Funding Case D

New Money - Tax-Exempt VRA/VPSA Pool - Estimated Market Rates (5/19/20)
Radio Project - 15 Year Level Debt Service (VRA)

Admin Center Project — 20 Year Level Debt Service (VRA)

School Project - 20 Year Structured Debt Service (VPSA)

Strategic Refunding/Restructuring — VRA Pool - Estimated Market Rates (5/19/20)
Refunding of the 2017 Bond - 13 Years

Refunding of the 2013 Bond - 13 Years

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Assumes an estimated Summer VRA Pooled Financing for the Radio and Admin Center Projects, a tax-exempt refunding of the 2017 Bond, and a tax-exempt
refunding of the 2013 Bond and an estimated Fall VPSA Pooled Financing for the School Project based on estimated market interest rates of May 19, 2020. Actual results may vary from these estimates.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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Case D — Strategic Refunding/Restructuring Opportunity
Refunding/Restructuring of the 2013 and 2017 Bonds
® Davenport identified a potential opportunity to strategically refund/restructure $7.8 million of outstanding tax-supported

debt, consisting of the 2013 Public Facility Lease Revenue Bond (the “2013 Bond”) and 2017 Public Improvement
Refunding Bond (the “2017 Bond”).

®m A Refunding/Restructuring of the 2013 and 2017 Bonds could allow the County to free up cash flow over the next 8 years in
order to mitigate the budgetary impact of the Capital Projects.

® The table below summarizes the 2013 and 2017 Bonds to be considered for the Refunding/Restructuring.

Outstanding

Series/Project 6/30/2020 Interest Rate  Final Maturity Call Provision
2013 Public Facility Lease Revenue Bond $ 6,205,000 2.15% 11/1/2027 11/1/2021 @ 100%
2017 Public Improvement Refunding Bond 1,565,550 2.39% 8/1/2027 8/1/2020 @ 102%
Totals $ 7,770,550

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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Case D — Strategic Refunding/Restructuring Opportunity (cont.)

® Based on estimated market interest rates, the Strategic Refunding/Restructuring could potentially:
— Free up approximately $3.1 million in cash flow in FY 2021-2028 (see yellow shading below);

— Average interest rate on Refunded Debt equal to approximately 2.20%. Estimated average interest rate on
Refunding Debt equal to approximately 1.22%;

— At a Present Value Cost of approximately $200,000.

Estimated Debt Service Before & After
the Refunding/Restructuring

A B C D=A-B+C E=A-D
o $1.6
2020 S
Existing Debt Restructured Restructuring Resulting = $14
Service Debt Service Debt Service Debt Service Savings $1.0
Total $10,378,898 $8,424,967 $8,896,078 $10,850,009 ($471,112)
2020 $1,437,407 $0 $0 $1,437,407 $0 $1.0
2021 1,428,490 967,030 244,628 706,088 722,402
2022 1,109,231 1,081,699 711,081 738,613 370,618 $0.8
2023 1,109,439 1,081,907 715,453 742,985 366,454 $0.6
2024 1,081,765 1,081,765 723,416 723,416 358,349
2025 1,081,793 1,081,793 724,969 724,969 356,824 $0.4
2026 1,081,956 1,081,956 720,369 720,369 361,587 $0.2
2027 1,081,751 1,081,751 724,488 724,488 357,264
2028 967,066 967,066 722,197 722,197 244,869 $0.0 ——
2029 - - 723,497 723,497 (723,497) Q N SV D > o © A b O O N SV D
2030 ; ; 723,259 723,259 (723,259) q,°q’ q,& q,& q,& q,°q’ q,& q,& q,Qq' q,Qq' q,& (19% q,orb q,& q,&
2031 - - 721,484 721,484 (721,484)
2032 i . 718,172 718,172 (718,172) 2020 Restructuring Debt Service I Unrefinanced Debt Service
2033 - - 723,066 723,066 (723,066)

= Existing Debt Service

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Assumes an estimated Summer VRA Pooled Financing for a tax-exempt refunding of the 2017 Bond, and a tax-exempt refunding of the 2013 Bond based on
estimated market interest rates as of May 19, 2020. Actual results may vary from these estimates.
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Estimated Resulting Debt Service — Case D

A B sumofA:B
3.0
Restructured Total New Money Total Debt
Debt Service Debt Service Service

2.5 Total  $10,850,009 $ 21,042,836 $ 31,892,845
2020 1,437,407 - 1,437,407
2021 706,088 209,549 915,637
2.0 2022 738,613 914,794 1,653,407
2023 742,985 900,335 1,643,320
2 2024 723,416 898,085 1,621,501
j‘:f 3 N R R R R 2025 724,969 899,940 1,624,909
= 15 — 2026 720,369 895,900 1,616,269
2 2027 724,488 900,839 1,625,326
- 2028 722,197 899,628 1,621,825
1.0 BN BN BN Em Em 2029 723,497 897,394 1,620,891
i 2030 723,259 899,011 1,622,271
2031 721,484 894,479 1,615,963
2032 718,172 893,795 1,611,967
05 2033 723,066 896,706 1,619,771
2034 - 1,542,698 1,542,698
2035 - 1,546,414 1,546,414
0.0 2036 - 1,542,990 1,542,990
SHNRILREERRENAIRERRL ST 205 - aomas somais
19 'S VAR « VAR« VAR« VIR VA e VA VA o VAN o VY o VY o Y o VAR VAR o VAR e VAR VAR o VAo VAR o VIR o VIR oY 2038 - 1,079,091 1,079,091
2039 - 1,084,448 1,084,448
® Restructured Debt Service ™ Radio Project ™ School Project ® Admin Center 2040 _ 1,083,356 1,083,356
2041 - 1,081,271 1,081,271

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Assumes an estimated Summer VRA Pooled Financing for the Radio and Admin Center Projects, a tax-exempt refunding of the 2017 Bond, and a tax-exempt
refunding of the 2013 Bond and an estimated Fall VPSA Pooled Financing for the School Project based on estimated market interest rates of May 19, 2020. Actual results may vary from these estimates.

DAVENPORT & COMPANY

May 26, 2020 27



Penny Impact Analysis — Case D

* Penny Impact Analysis assumes the Value of one penny to be $175,000 with no growth in value.

e Assumes the County begins FY 2020 with a Debt Service Stabilization Fund Balance of $1,242,497.

A B (o4 D E=sumA:D F G=E-F H I J=F+]
Total Incremental GClhAliE]]
Restructured Equivalent Revenue
Restructured and Additional Real Estate REEgeXsII10] Total
Fiscal Debt School Admin Proposed DLISSLIGEN  Revenue Tax by Tax Available
Year  Service'¥ Radio Project Project Center Debt Service Budget‘? Required  Impact® HIE T IS
2020 $1,437,407 $0 $0 $0 $1,437,407 $1,437,407 - - $0 $1,437,407
2021 706,088 172,872 0 36,677 915,637 1,437,407 - - 0 1,437,407
2022 738,613 448,325 382,728 83,741 1,653,407 1,437,407 216,000 0.5¢ 87,500 1,524,907
2023 742,985 451,666 366,723 81,947 1,643,320 1,437,407 205,913 - 87,500 1,524,907
2024 723,416 449,366 368,566 80,153 1,621,501 1,437,407 184,094 - 87,500 1,524,907
2025 724,969 451,425 365,284 83,231 1,624,909 1,437,407 187,502 - 87,500 1,524,907
2026 720,369 447,844 366,875 81,181 1,616,269 1,437,407 178,862 - 87,500 1,524,907
2027 724,488 448,622 368,214 84,003 1,625,326 1,437,407 187,919 - 87,500 1,524,907
2028 722,197 448,631 369,300 81,697 1,621,825 1,437,407 184,418 - 87,500 1,524,907
2029 723,497 447,872 365,260 84,263 1,620,891 1,437,407 183,484 - 87,500 1,524,907
2030 723,259 446,344 370,968 81,700 1,622,271 1,437,407 184,864 - 87,500 1,524,907
2031 721,484 444,047 366,423 84,009 1,615,963 1,437,407 178,556 - 87,500 1,524,907
2032 718,172 445,853 366,751 81,191 1,611,967 1,437,407 174,560 - 87,500 1,524,907
2033 723,066 446,634 366,828 83,244 1,619,771 1,437,407 182,364 - 87,500 1,524,907
2034 0 443,519 1,018,710 80,469 1,542,698 1,437,407 105,291 - 87,500 1,524,907
2035 0 446,606 1,016,918 82,891 1,546,414 1,437,407 109,007 - 87,500 1,524,907
2036 0 443,972 1,018,809 80,209 1,542,990 1,437,407 105,583 - 87,500 1,524,907
2037 0 0 999,688 82,425 1,082,113 1,437,407 - - 87,500 1,524,907
2038 0 0 999,554 79,538 1,079,091 1,437,407 - - 87,500 1,524,907
2039 0 0 1,002,901 81,547 1,084,448 1,437,407 - - 87,500 1,524,907
2040 0 0 999,606 83,750 1,083,356 1,437,407 - - 87,500 1,524,907
2041 0 0 1,000,021 81,250 1,081,271 1,437,407 - - 87,500 1,524,907
0.5¢

DAVENPORT & COMPANY

(1) Restructured tax supported debt service as of 6/30/2019.

(2) Debt Service Budget based on the County's existing FY 2020 Debt Service.

(3) Value of one penny on the real estate tax rate assumed to be $175,000.

(4) Additional Revenue equal to cumulative penny increase(s) multiplied by $175,000.

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Assumes an estimated Summer VRA Pooled Financing for the Radio and Admin Center Projects, a tax-exempt refunding of the 2017 Bond, and a tax-exempt
refunding of the 2013 Bond and an estimated Fall VPSA Pooled Financing for the School Project based on estimated market interest rates of May 19, 2020. Actual results may vary from these estimates.
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Debt Service Stabilization Fund — Case D

* Penny Impact Analysis assumes the Value of one penny to be $175,000 with no growth in value.

e Assumes the County begins FY 2020 with a Debt Service Stabilization Fund Balance of $1,242,497.

J=F+] K=E L=J-K M N=L-M 0]
Surplus/(Deficit) Surplus/(Deficit)
Total before use of Debt Service after use of

Restructured Debt Service Stabilization Debt Service Debt Service
Fiscal Total Available and Proposed Stabilization Fund used for Stabilization Stabilization
Year Revenues Debt Service Fund Debt Service Fund Fund Balance
2020 $1,437,407 $1,437,407 $0 $0 $0 $1,242,497
2021 1,437,407 915,637 521,770 0 521,770 1,764,267
2022 1,524,907 1,653,407 (128,500) (128,500) 0 1,635,766
2023 1,524,907 1,643,320 (118,413) (118,413) 0 1,517,353
2024 1,524,907 1,621,501 (96,594) (96,594) 0 1,420,760
2025 1,524,907 1,624,909 (100,002) (100,002) 0 1,320,758
2026 1,524,907 1,616,269 (91,362) (91,362) 0 1,229,396
2027 1,524,907 1,625,326 (100,419) (100,419) 0 1,128,977
2028 1,524,907 1,621,825 (96,918) (96,918) 0 1,032,059
2029 1,524,907 1,620,891 (95,984) (95,984) 0 936,075
2030 1,524,907 1,622,271 (97,364) (97,364) 0 838,711
2031 1,524,907 1,615,963 (91,056) (91,056) 0 747,655
2032 1,524,907 1,611,967 (87,060) (87,060) 0 660,595
2033 1,524,907 1,619,771 (94,864) (94,864) 0 565,731
2034 1,524,907 1,542,698 (17,791) (17,791) 0 547,940
2035 1,524,907 1,546,414 (21,507) (21,507) 0 526,433
2036 1,524,907 1,542,990 (18,083) (18,083) 0 508,350
2037 1,524,907 1,082,113 442,794 0 442,794 951,144
2038 1,524,907 1,079,091 445,816 0 445,816 1,396,960
2039 1,524,907 1,084,448 440,459 0 440,459 1,837,419
2040 1,524,907 1,083,356 441,551 0 441,551 2,278,970
2041 1,524,907 1,081,271 443,636 0 443,636 2,722,605

Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Assumes an estimated Summer VRA Pooled Financing for the Radio and Admin Center Projects, a tax-exempt refunding of the 2017 Bond, and a tax-exempt
refunding of the 2013 Bond and an estimated Fall VPSA Pooled Financing for the School Project based on estimated market interest rates of May 19, 2020. Actual results may vary from these estimates.
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Estimated results are preliminary, subject to change. Based on Sterling National Bank’s proposed 2.96% interest rate for the Radio Project, Admin Center Project, and School Project Financings.
Actual results may vary from these estimates.
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Detailed Bid Summary

Key Government
Finance

o=
./ /' ! [/ | |

2020A - New Money County Capital Projects
2020B - Refunding of Series 2017 Bond
2020C - Refunding of Series 2013 Bond

STERLING

NATIONAL BANK

2020A - New Money County Capital Projects
2020B - Refunding of Series 2017 Bond
2020C - Refunding of Series 2013 Bond

Purpose

2020A (New Money) - $16,600,000
20208 (Refunds 2017 Bond) - $1,750,000
2020C (Refunds 2013 Bond)- $6,700,000

2020A (New Money) - No Bid
20208 (Refunds 2017 Bond) - $1,750,000
2020C (Refunds 2013 Bond) - $6,700,000

Maximum Par Amount

2020A (New Money) - Tax-Exempt
2020B (Refunds 2017 Bond) - Tax-Exempt
2020C (Refunds 2013 Bond) - Provided Taxable and Tax-Exempt rates.

2020A (New Money) - No Bid
2020B (Refunds 2017 Bond) - Tax-Exempt
2020C (Refunds 2013 Bond) - Provided Taxable and Tax-Exempt rates.

Tax Status

"Moral Obligation pledge of the County’s Board of Supervisors, a Lease Agreement between the
Authority and the County, a Ground Lease on one or more County buildings, and an Assignment
Agreement that would assign the leases to the lender as collateral."

"Moral Obligation pledge of the County’s Board of Supervisors, a Lease Agreement between the
Authority and the County, a Ground Lease on a County building(s), and an Assignment Agreement that
would assign the leases to the lender as collateral or a comparable lease financing structure."

Security/Collateral

2020A (New Money) 20208 (Refunds 2017 Bond) 2020C (Refunds 2013 Bond)

Interest Rate

2020A (New Money)

Amortization 1-2.96%
Amortization 2 -3.00%

Amortization 1-2.45%
Amortization 2-2.37%

Tax-Exempt-2.39%
Taxable -3.19%

No Bid

20208 (Refunds 2017 Bond)

2020C (Refunds 2013 Bond)

Amortization 1-2.868%
Amortization 2 -2.583%

Tax-Exempt-2.636%
Taxable -3.343%

Interest Mode Fixed through Final Maturity. Fixed through Final Maturity.

2020A (New Money) - February 1, 204 1.
2020B (Refunds 2017 Bond) - February 1, 2033.
2020C (Refunds 2013 Bond) - February 1, 2033.

2020A (New Money) - No Bid.
2020B (Refunds 2017 Bond) - February 1, 2033.
2020C (Refunds 2013 Bond) - February 1, 2033.

Final Maturity

Before 1/31/2025 - No Call

Prepayment Provisions
pay On or After 2/1/2025 - Prepayable In whole, but not in part, anytime at par.

Prepayable in whole, but not in part, anytime at par.

No up-front fee.
Lender's Counsel fees will be paid by the Lender.
May 26, 2020.
June 26, 2020.
Select terms and conditions shown below.
See complete proposal for full terms and conditions.
Subject to Final Credit Approval.
- Above rates are quoted based on market conditions as of May 19, 2020. At the County's request,
Key can provide a rate lock option good through a June 26, 2020 closing date.

- The quoted interest rates assume that Key would be awarded both the 2020B and 2020C Bonds.
- Gross-up Provision: In the Event of Taxability, the 2020B Bond's Tax-Exempt interest rate would
convert to the Taxable interest rate of 3.630% for Amortization 1 and 3.270% for Amortization 2. The
2020C Bond would convert to the Taxable rate of 3.343%.

- Conditions Precedent to Closing: see items 1 through 10 on pg. 3 of the proposal.

Bank / Legal Fees Not to exceed $10,000 as total fee for Bank Counsel.

Proposal to be Accepted by May 27,2020.
June 26, 2020.
Select terms and conditions shown below.

See complete proposal for full terms and conditions.
Subject to Final Credit Approval.
- Quoted interest rates are valid for a closing on or before June 26, 2020.

Proposal Expiration
Notes /
Other Terms & Conditions

DAVENPORT & COMPANY
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MMD Trends Since March 6, 2020

AAA MMD -3/6/20 through 5/21/20

Date Friday
Date 3/6/2020
2021 0.52
2022 0.53
2023 0.54
2024 0.55
2025 0.57
2026 0.63
2027 0.69
2028 0.75
2029 0.81
2031 0.91
2032 0.96
2033 1
2034 1.04
2035 1.08
2036 1.12
2037 1.16
2038 1.2
2039 1.24
2041 1.3
2042 1.33
2043 1.36
2044 1.39
2045 1.41
2046 1.42
2047 1.43
2048 1.44
2049 1.45
1

DAVENPORT & COMPANY

Friday

1.11
1.12
1.13
1.15
1.2
1.3
.39
.46
.53

.76
.81
.86
91
1.96
2.01
2.05
2.09

1
1
1
1
1.69
1
1
1
1

2.16
2.19
2.22
2.25
2.27
2.28
2.29
2.3
2.31

Friday

3/13/2020 3/20/2020

2.51
2.52
2.53
2.53
2.56
2.6
2.64
2.69
2.73

2.84
2.88
2.91
2.94
2.96
3.01
3.06
3.1
3.14

3.21
3.24
3.27
3.3
3.32
3.33
3.34
3.35
3.36

Friday
3/27/2020
.05
.06
.07
.07
.09
a1
.14
.18
.22

31
.35
.38
41
43
48
.53
.57
.61

.68
71
74
77
.79
.80
.81
.82
.83

Friday
4/3/2020
1.17
1.18
1.19
1.19
1.21
1.27
1.35
1.44
1.53

1

1.73
1.83
1.93
1.98
2.03
2.08
2.13
2.17
2.21

2.28
2.31
2.34
2.37
2.39
2.40
2.41
2.42
2.43

Thursday
4/9/2020
0.92
0.93
0.94
0.94
0.95
0.97

Friday Friday
4/17/2020 4/24/2020
0.82 0.85
0.85 0.90
0.86 0.95
0.86 0.98
0.87 1.01
0.89 1.06
0.92 1.11
0.95 1.17
0.99 1.22

. 1
1.17 1.38
1.27 1.48
1.37 1.58
1.42 1.63
1.47 1.68
1.53 1.74
1.59 1.80
1.63 1.84
1.67 1.88
1. 1
1.74 1.96
1.77 2.00
1.80 2.03
1.83 2.06
1.85 2.08
1.86 2.09
1.87 2.10
1.88 2.11
1.89 2.12
1.

Friday
5/1/2020
0.77
0.87
0.91
0.97
1.04
.09
15
21
.28

1

1

1

1

1
1.45
1.55
1.65
1.69
1.74
1.78
1.83
1.87
1.91
1

1.99
2.03
2.06
2.09
2.11
2.12
2.13
2.14
2.15

Friday
5/8/2020
0.58
0.63
0.67
0.78
0.87
0.93
0.98

.09

.26
.36
.46
.50
.55
.59
.64
.68
.72

.80
.84
.87
.90
.92
.93
.94
.95
.96

— [T TR . [P — -

Friday Thursday
5/15/2020 5/21/2020
0.43 0.17
0.49 0.23
0.56 0.30
0.63 0.37
0.72 0.46
0.78 0.59
0.83 0.69
0.88 0.75
0.94 0.81
1.11 0.99
1.21 1.09
1.31 1.19
1.35 1.23
1.40 1.28
1.44 1.32
1.49 1.37
1.53 1.41
1.57 1.45

1. 1.

1.65 1.53
1.69 1.57
1.72 1.60
1.75 1.63
1.77 1.65
1.78 1.66
1.79 1.67
1.80 1.68
1.81 1.69
1. 1.
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Municipal Advisor Disclaimer

The enclosed information relates to an existing or potential municipal advisor engagement.

The U.S. Securities and Exchange Commission (the “SEC”) has clarified that a broker, dealer or municipal securities dealer engaging in municipal advisory activities outside the scope of underwriting
a particular issuance of municipal securities should be subject to municipal advisor registration. Davenport & Company LLC (“Davenport”) has registered as a municipal advisor with the SEC. As a
registered municipal advisor Davenport may provide advice to a municipal entity or obligated person. An obligated person is an entity other than a municipal entity, such as a not for profit
corporation, that has commenced an application or negotiation with an entity to issue municipal securities on its behalf and for which it will provide support. If and when an issuer engages
Davenport to provide financial advisory or consultant services with respect to the issuance of municipal securities, Davenport is obligated to evidence such a financial advisory relationship with a
written agreement.

When acting as a registered municipal advisor Davenport is a fiduciary required by federal law to act in the best interest of a municipal entity without regard to its own financial or other interests.
Davenport is not a fiduciary when it acts as a registered investment advisor, when advising an obligated person, or when acting as an underwriter, though it is required to deal fairly with such
persons.

This material was prepared by public finance, or other non-research personnel of Davenport. This material was not produced by a research analyst, although it may refer to a Davenport research
analyst or research report. Unless otherwise indicated, these views (if any) are the author’s and may differ from those of the Davenport fixed income or research department or others in the firm.
Davenport may perform or seek to perform financial advisory services for the issuers of the securities and instruments mentioned herein.

This material has been prepared for information purposes only and is not a solicitation of any offer to buy or sell any security/instrument or to participate in any trading strategy. Any such offer
would be made only after a prospective participant had completed its own independent investigation of the securities, instruments or transactions and received all information it required to make its
own investment decision, including, where applicable, a review of any offering circular or memorandum describing such security or instrument. That information would contain material information
not contained herein and to which prospective participants are referred. This material is based on public information as of the specified date, and may be stale thereafter. We have no obligation to
tell you when information herein may change. We make no representation or warranty with respect to the completeness of this material. Davenport has no obligation to continue to publish
information on the securities/instruments mentioned herein. Recipients are required to comply with any legal or contractual restrictions on their purchase, holding, sale, exercise of rights or
performance of obligations under any securities/instruments transaction.

The securities/instruments discussed in this material may not be suitable for all investors or issuers. Recipients should seek independent financial advice prior to making any investment decision
based on this material. This material does not provide individually tailored investment advice or offer tax, regulatory, accounting or legal advice. Prior to entering into any proposed transaction,
recipients should determine, in consultation with their own investment, legal, tax, regulatory and accounting advisors, the economic risks and merits, as well as the legal, tax, regulatory and
accounting characteristics and consequences, of the transaction. You should consider this material as only a single factor in making an investment decision.

The value of and income from investments and the cost of borrowing may vary because of changes in interest rates, foreign exchange rates, default rates, prepayment rates, securities/instruments
prices, market indexes, operational or financial conditions or companies or other factors. There may be time limitations on the exercise of options or other rights in securities/instruments
transactions. Past performance is not necessarily a guide to future performance and estimates of future performance are based on assumptions that may not be realized. Actual events may differ
from those assumed and changes to any assumptions may have a material impact on any projections or estimates. Other events not taken into account may occur and may significantly affect the
projections or estimates. Certain assumptions may have been made for modeling purposes or to simplify the presentation and/or calculation of any projections or estimates, and Davenport does
not represent that any such assumptions will reflect actual future events. Accordingly, there can be no assurance that estimated returns or projections will be realized or that actual returns or
performance results will not materially differ from those estimated herein. This material may not be sold or redistributed without the prior written consent of Davenport.

Version 1.13.14 SZ | JU | GM | KL

DAvENPORT & COMPANY

May 26, 2020 33



